Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 March 2022 3:38 PM

To: '‘Nagiah'

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Swee Peng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: MC/MC 9136/2020 | KCP Ref: 2020001226.Sompo(mpd) | Riaz Ref:
WAN.IN.515465.Q| PLF: FBL 3431H | DEF: SKV 2271A | DOA: 6 February 2020

Attachments: L135_LKKInvoice_AC2201822.pdf

Dear Nagiah,
Attached herewith our tax invoice for Mr Bryan Ang’s Court Attendance on 25 March 2022.

We shall be glad if you could forward the payment at your early convenience.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nagiah <riaz@justice.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 March 2022 10:37 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; Swee Peng
(LKKAuto) <ongsp@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MC/MC 9136/2020 | KCP Ref: 2020001226.Sompo(mpd) | Riaz Ref: WAN.IN.515465.Q| PLF: FBL 3431H
| DEF: SKV 2271A | DOA: 6 February 2020

Hi Celine,
The signed confirmation slip is enclosed.

Kindly inform Mr Bryan the Court venue is at Chambers 2-31 at Level 2 of the State Courts.

Regards,

Nagiah

Paralegal to Mr. Ridhwan / Mr. Irfan
Riaz LLC

Advocates and Solicitors

Tel: 6534 0110 | Fax: 6534 0220

Disclaimer: This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the name recipient. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail
has reached you in error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform of the error by sending an e-mail to
riaz@justice.com.sg Though internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost or infected with viruses, we have canned this message to minimize the possibility of corruption.




From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 March 2022 1:53 PM

To: Nagiah <riaz@justice.com.sg>

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@I|kkauto.com>; Swee Peng
(LKKAuto) <ongsp@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MC/MC 9136/2020 | KCP Ref: 2020001226.Sompo(mpd) | Riaz Ref: WAN.IN.515465.Q| PLF: FBL 3431H
| DEF: SKV 2271A | DOA: 6 February 2020

Dear Nagiah,

We write to confirm the court attendance on this Friday, 25" March 2022 at 2:30pm.
Kindly chop and sign the Confirmation Slip and forward back to us.

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 March 2022 6:22 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Nagiah <riaz@justice.com.sg>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
<bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: MC/MC 9136/2020 | KCP Ref: 2020001226.Sompo(mpd) | Riaz Ref: WAN.IN.515465.Q| PLF: FBL 3431H
| DEF: SKV 2271A | DOA: 6 February 2020

Importance: High

Hi Celine,
Need your immediate assistance, thank you!

Thanks & regards,
SweePeng

From: Nagiah <riaz@justice.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 March 2022 6:12 PM

To: Mary Low (LKK Auto) <MaryLow@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MC/MC 9136/2020 | KCP Ref: 2020001226.Sompo(mpd) | Riaz Ref: WAN.IN.515465.Q| PLF: FBL 3431H
| DEF: SKV 2271A | DOA: 6 February 2020

Importance: High

URGENT

Dear Mary,



Apologies for the very short notice but please be informed that the Court have fixed an Assessment of Damages
hearing for the surveyor (Bryan Ang) to give evidence this Friday, 25" March 2022 at 2:30pm.

The SJE’s attendance is compulsory for this matter.

Please acknowledge receipt of this email.

Regards,

Nagiah

Paralegal to Mr. Ridhwan / Mr. Irfan
Riaz LLC

Advocates and Solicitors

Tel: 6534 0110 |Fax: 6534 0220

Disclaimer: This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the name recipient. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail
has reached you in error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform of the error by sending an e-mail to
riaz@justice.com.sg Though internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost or infected with viruses, we have canned this message to minimize the possibility of corruption.

From: Mary Low (LKK Auto) <MaryLow@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 December 2021 10:29 AM

To: Nicole <riaz@justice.com.sg>

Cc: Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: MC/MC 9136/2020 | KCP Ref: 2020001226.Sompo(mpd) | Riaz Ref: IN.515465.E(W)| PLF: FBL 3431H |
DEF: SKV 2271A | DOA: 6 February 2020

Dear Nicole,

Noted, thank you.

Best Regards,

Mary Low | Account Dept

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

National Assessment Centre Services

DID: 6742 9588 | email: Account@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: Nicole [mailto:riaz@justice.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 2 December 2021 4:53 PM

To: 'Mary Low (LKK Auto)' <MaryLow@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Accounts (LKKAuto)' <account@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MC/MC 9136/2020 | KCP Ref: 2020001226.Sompo(mpd) | Riaz Ref: IN.515465.E(W)| PLF: FBL 3431H |
DEF: SKV 2271A | DOA: 6 February 2020




Dear Mary
We refer to the above mater and the recent tele-conversation.

Please find attached herewith our cover letter and cheque for your further action. The original cheque will be sent
to your office via mail.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Nicole Ngou

Legal Executive

RIAZ LLC

133 NEW BRIDGE ROAD

# 09-09 CHINATOWN POINT
SINGAPORE 059413

TEL :6534-0110

FAX : 6534-0220

From: Mary Low (LKK Auto) <MaryLow@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 20, 2021 2:58 PM

To: Teo Yi Xuan <teo.yixuan@kcpartnership.com>; irfanriazllc@gmail.com

Cc: Nagiah <riaz@justice.com.sg>; Irfan Nasrulhaq <irfanriazllc@gmail.com>; Sarjeet Singh
<sarjeet.singh@kcpartnership.com>; Shanthi Marimuthu <shanthi.marimuthu@kcpartnership.com>; Foo Shu Hui
<foo.shuhui@kcpartnership.com>; Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@|kkauto.com>

Subject: SJE: MC/MC 9136/2020 | KCP Ref: 2020001226.Sompo(mpd) | Riaz Ref: IN.515465.E(W)| PLF: FBL 3431H |
DEF: SKV 2271A | DOA: 6 February 2020

Dear Yi Xuan / Irfan,

We have completed the Inspection Report for the above.

Attached herewith our Reports and Invoices for your payment please.

Please notify us upon payment is done.

Please find below our bank details:-

Name of Bank Account LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Name of Bank UOB Ltd

Bank — Branch No. 7375 -016

Account No. 339-301-993-8

Email address for remittance advice account@lkkauto.com

PAYNOW ID 199607198R002

Swift Code UOVBSGSG




Your soonest action is much appreciated

Best Regards,

Mary Low | Account Depft

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

National Assessment Centre Services

DID: 6742 9588 | email: Account@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



