Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

We accept the finalisation.

Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>
Monday, 3 May 2021 4:45 PM

Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Veron Chen (LKKAuto); shien@satmotors.com
Re: SLG 5538D - Finalize

Please proceed to close the file on your end we will submit the LOD in 1x Week time.

Kindly send me the OIC for this case as well as email address.

Motor Claims Department

AUTO MEGA MALL PTE LTD [HQ]

From: "Steve Chen (LKK Auto)" <SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com>

Date: Friday, 30 April 2021 at 10:40 AM

To: "motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg" <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>
Cc: "Veron Chen (LKKAuto)" <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SLG 5538D - Finalize

Hi Jonathan,

Kindly refer our finalize $1950 (L/S, before GST). 3 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




