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Re: Finalization on COR SLR 1754 P : / DOA: 16/04/2021

Team AutoPro <tap.finalization@gmail.com>
Mon 24/5/2021 5:24 PM
To:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Dear All ,

Without Prejudice
   
Thank You for your prompt reply.

We are pleased to confirm our acceptance to your proposed COR @ $6,900.00 & 08 Repair Days.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not prejudice our client’s

claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal injuries.* 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
-----------
Cheers,
John Ko 
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 
HP : 6258 1955
Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Virus-free. www.avg.com

On Mon, May 24, 2021 at 4:23 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
hi,
 
Any confirma�on?
COR recommended for the above-men�oned vehicle is lump sum $6,900.00 with 8 repair days 
 
 
Thanks and regards,
Denise
Case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: ' 62563561 Fax: 6 6256 4315
Email: + sur@lkkauto.com

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 11:54 AM 
To: Team AutoPro <tap.finaliza�on@gmail.com> 
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Finaliza�on on COR SLR 1754 P : / DOA: 16/04/2021
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Without Prejudice

 

Hi John,

 

A�ached is the adjusted es�mate for SLR 1754P

 

COR recommended for the above-men�oned vehicle is lump sum $6,900.00 with 8 repair days, subjected
to approval of the insurance company.

If you are agreeable with our offer, please send the necessary documents our Case Handler Ms Denise
Tay  ASAP.

 

 

Best Regards,

TG Lim | Automo�ve Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

 

 

From: Team AutoPro [mailto:tap.finalization@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 17 May, 2021 11:17 AM 
To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Re: Finalization on COR SLR 1754 P : / DOA: 16/04/2021

 

Dear Mr Lim ,

 

Good day to you and hope this email serves you well.

 

We would like to follow up with you on the finalize amount for the subject vehicle.

 

Await soonest your favorable reply  
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Thousand appreciation.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle
and shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss
in relation to his personal injuries.*

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
--------------

Cheers,

John Ko

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

HP : 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

 

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

 

 

On Tue, May 4, 2021 at 10:01 AM Team AutoPro <tap.finalization@gmail.com> wrote:

 Gd Day ,

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Thank You for assisting as SJE for subject vehicle 

 

Attach with marked estimate and after marked estimate amount 

 

Parts After Discount                      - $ 8400.75

Special Netts                                 - $ 320.00

Labour                                           - $ 2570.00

 

Sub Total ( Parts + S/N + Labour) - $ 11290.70
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L/S - 20% - $ 9032.50 and 8 Repair Days

 

Enclosed herewith after-repair photos FYN.  

 

Look forward to your favorable reply .

 

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle
and shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss
in relation to his personal injuries.*

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
----------------

Cheers,

John Ko

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

HP : 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

 

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Virus-free. www.avg.com
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