Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 June 2021 3:27 PM

To: operation@tlauto.com.sg; SUR

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: GBG9738K--Supplier's invoices and finalised
Attachments: GBG9738K--Supplier.pdf; GBG9738K---Finalised.pdf
Dear Candy,

As spoken this morning, supplementary Labour is $100.
Finalize amount $5523.10 before excess $1900 @ 5 days.

Will offer in merimen shortly.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 June 2021 10:26 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: GBG9738K--Supplier's invoices and finalised

From: Operation / Candy Ong <operation@tlauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 4 June 2021 4:15 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: GBG9738K--Supplier's invoices and finalised

Hi Kenneth,
Please find attached supplier’s invoices for your attention and finalization

Kindly revert



Best Regards,
Candy Ong
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd



