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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 17 May 2021 12:05 PM
To: 'Lim Jonathan'
Cc: shien@satmotors.com; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: SLS 4246P - LOD Submission SLS4246P MAZDA CX-5 DOA 15.04.2021
Attachments: DS FORM_SLS4246P.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 14 May 2021 2:33 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: shien@satmotors.com; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLS 4246P - LOD Submission SLS4246P MAZDA CX-5 DOA 15.04.2021 
 
Good day Hsiao Tong, 
 
Thanks for the email. We accept the $4500.00 all-in proposal. Please kindly send us the discharge voucher 
so that we can close this case soonest directly without incurring anymore cost. 
 
Thanks! 
 
Motor Claims Department  
AUTO MEGA MALL PTE LTD [HQ] 
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #05-28  
Paya Ubi Industrial Park S408933 
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Mobile: (65) 9455 6064 
Email: Motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg 
 
WORKSHOP ADDRESS: 
No. 8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 @ Premier @02-13 
Singapore 415875 
 

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Friday, 14 May 2021 at 8:41 AM 
To: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg> 
Cc: "shien@satmotors.com" <shien@satmotors.com>, "Steve Chen (LKK Auto)" 
<SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLS 4246P - LOD Submission SLS4246P MAZDA CX-5 DOA 15.04.2021 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We propose settlement at $4,500.00(all-in) 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 6 May 2021 11:55 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: shien@satmotors.com <shien@satmotors.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLS 4246P - LOD Submission SLS4246P MAZDA CX-5 DOA 15.04.2021  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE, 
 
Your REF: TO BE ADVISED 
Our REF: AMM2102-07-SJG8408A 
 
Good day Hsiao Tong, 
 
I hope my email find you well.  
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Kindly assist us in the closure of this case soonest possible thanks!  
 
Send us the discharge voucher after you liaises with AXA the TP insurers for this matter. 
  
  
  
Motor Claims Department  
AUTO MEGA MALL PTE LTD [HQ] 
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #05-28  
Paya Ubi Industrial Park S408933 
Mobile: (65) 9455 6064 
Email: Motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg 
  
  

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Tuesday, 4 May 2021 at 1:47 PM 
To: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg> 
Cc: "shien@satmotors.com" <shien@satmotors.com>, "Steve Chen (LKK Auto)" 
<SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLS 4246P - Finalize 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Jonathan, 
  
Thank you for your email. 
  
Kindly forward your LOD with all the documents to me. 
  
Thanks. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 3 May 2021 4:45 PM 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; shien@satmotors.com 
Subject: Re: SLS 4246P - Finalize 
  
We accept the finalisation. 
  
Please proceed to close the file on your end we will submit the LOD in 1x Week time. 
  
Kindly send me the OIC for this case as well as email address. 
  
  
Motor Claims Department  
AUTO MEGA MALL PTE LTD [HQ] 
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #05-28  
Paya Ubi Industrial Park S408933 
Mobile: (65) 9455 6064 
Email: Motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg 
  
  

From: "Steve Chen (LKK Auto)" <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Date: Friday, 30 April 2021 at 5:50 PM 
To: "motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg" <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg> 
Cc: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SLS 4246P - Finalize 
  
Hi Jonathan, 
  
Kindly refer our finalize $4000 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days. 
  
Kindly confirm. 
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
Thanks. 
  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


