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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 15 July 2021 5:02 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; Ramesh; Hasrianah Binte Hassan
Subject: RE: Accident case between GBH2113D & GBB2755H  (your insured) on 14/04/2021 @ 

1730 hrs at Sengkang E Rd Our Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024454  *** LKK REF: 
CC4/LPC21004799/ga3 [External General]

Dear Ms. Cecilia, 
 
Please be informed that the Final repair bill amount is auto generate by our system and I unable to amend 

it. 
 
Kindly please send to us workshop discharge voucher (release voucher). 
 
Thank you. 
 
NOTICE: 

Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are 

to be expected. 

All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 

 

Catherine Chong Kai Ling | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 
 
 
t:  | m:9736 1300  | f:  | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, July 15, 2021 3:50 PM 

To: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Hasrianah Binte Hassan 

<Hasrianah@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Accident case between GBH2113D & GBB2755H (your insured) on 14/04/2021 @ 1730 hrs at Sengkang 

E Rd Our Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024454 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21004799/ga3 [External General] 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Catherine,  
 
Kindly provide amended LOD and Final repair bill as the finalise COR amount before GST is $ 9,539.36, aft 

GST is $10,207.12.  
 
Thanks  
 


