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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 20 May 2021 12:37 PM
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/FM&SuppSvcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA); Asher Sng 

(LKKAuto)
Cc: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: RE: LOD   Re: Accident on 13/4/2021 involving SHB 5555C, SMZ 112U (China 

Taiping's insured) etc   Our Ref: TAX/04/21/2034/lg  *** LKK REF: 
CC3/CTI21004781/Qea3 

Attachments: 04 21 2034 - documents.pdf

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/FM&SuppSvcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) [mailto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 20 May 2021 11:38 AM 
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 13/4/2021 involving SHB 5555C, SMZ 112U (China Taiping's insured) etc Our Ref: 
TAX/04/21/2034/lg  
 
Dear All, 
 
We quantify our claim as follows:-  
 

Cost of Repair $14,150.00           

Loss of Rental $1,966.13 ( 17.5 days x $112.35 ) 

Loss of Income $90.00 ( **1.5 day x $60.00 ) 

LTA Search Fee $7.00           

Total $16,213.13           
 
We enclose the following documents:  

1)    Repair invoice  
2)    Proof of rental rate 
3)    GIA report  
4)    Police reports lodged by our driver and his witness  
4)    Accident vehicle laid-up report 
5)    LTA search 
6)    Letter of Authorisation 

 
Our relief driver Mr Koh Kwok Chuen (NRIC No. S1121441Z) is injured and is claiming his injury and loss of income (based 
on his medical leave) through his own lawyer. We are claiming the loss of income (based on downtime) on behalf of our 
hirer Mr Cheng Kin Mun (NRIC No. S1419401J).   
 
Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks. 
 
** our hirer took a replacement taxi on 14/4/2021 at 2.30pm. 
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548) 
Claims Department 
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd   

 












