Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 April 2021 10:51 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: PA6515Y

From: Chan Soo Lye <slchan@woodlandstransport.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 April 2021 10:51:33 AM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Wilson Ng <wilson.ng@woodlandstransport.com.sg>; Thomas Kong <thomas@woodlandstransport.com.sg>;
Lee Tong Ren kenji <kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PA6515Y

Hi Mr Rasul,

Confirmed $400.00 and 2 days.

Thank you.
Best Regards

Chan Soo Lye
Service Executive
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

@Wﬁndlands Transport

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd
8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564
Direct Line : +65 6559 8984 Fax 1 +65 6862 2163

Group of Companies: WTS t r{] ve' -’-‘), CASHBOX

PonGa 3
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Facebook Platforms:

Bus Charter:

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 20 April, 2021 8:58 AM

To: Chan Soo Lye

Subject: RE: PA6515Y

Hi Mr Chan,

Finalised amount is $ 400 / 2 days of repair



Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
F L -
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From: Chan Soo Lye [mailto:slchan@woodlandstransport.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 20 April, 2021 8:50 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Wilson Ng; Thomas Kong; Lee Tong Ren kenji

Subject: PA6515Y

Hi Mr Rasul,

Please refer the attach file PA6515Y after repair photos and advise us final repair cost.

Thank you.
Best Regards

Chan Soo Lye
Service Executive
WTS Engineering Pte Ltd

@Wﬁﬂdlands Transport

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd
8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564
Direct Line : +65 6559 8984 Fax 1 +65 6862 2163

Group of Companies: WTStrqvel -‘-"’ CASHBOX

Facebook Platforms:

Charter it () S—

Bus Charter:




