Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 24 May 2021 5:02 pm
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: FW: SLH 9815Y

From: daniel9633@hotmail.co.uk <daniel9633@hotmail.co.uk>

Sent: Monday, 24 May 2021 5:02:17 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLH 9815Y

Dear : Rasul
| here by accept & confirm your offer,the invoice where to email.Thanks

Best regards

Zenith Daniel Auto Services
Daniel Tan

97372883

Sent from Email.Avn for mobile

12:43 from Rasul@lkkauto.com:
Hi Daniel,

Refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 2,600 / 3 days of lump sum repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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