Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 2 July 2021 3:00 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FINALIZE :SGX1530X

Attachments: 27052021150110-0001.pdf; preinvoice SGX1530X.xIsx; WhatsApp Image 2021-05-27 at

3.06.16 PM (1).,jpg; WhatsApp Image 2021-05-27 at 3.06.16 PM.jpg; WhatsApp Image
2021-05-27 at 3.06.17 PM (1).jpg; WhatsApp Image 2021-05-27 at 3.06.17 PM.jpg

From: Kavi <kavi@tts.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 May 2021 1:38 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: shabir@tts.com.sg

Subject: FINALIZE :SGX1530X

Dear Kenneth,
Please find attached pre invoice, supplier invoice and after repair pic for your reference.

Finalize at $2776.50 before GST
No of repair days: 5 days

Kindly confirm, thank you.

Best Regards
Ms.Kavi

Motor Claims Officer

We are committed to the preservation of the environment. Please print this email only if it is absolutely necessary. TTS
Motor Group Pte Ltd (Co Reg No: 198702999Z) TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd (Co Reg No: 200413930H)

383 Sin Ming Drive TTS Centre Singapore 575717

Tel: (65) 97637000 Fax: (65) 6741 1626

Email: kavi@tts.com.sg

Website: www.tts.com.sg

Disclaimer: The information contained in this email, including any attachments, may contain confidential information of
TTS Motor Group Pte Ltd / TTS Eurocars Pte Ltd. This email is intended only for the use of the

addressee(s) listed above. Unauthorized review, dissemination or any other use of the information contained in this
email is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error or have reason to believe that you are not authorized
to receive it, please notify the sender by return email and promptly delete this email .****






