Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 June 2021 12:39 pm

To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: SLW 4098D DATE OF ACCIDENT : 11/04/21

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 June 2021 12:30 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SLW 4098D DATE OF ACCIDENT : 11/04/21

Case Finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥y L LS

Save the Larth- Frint only when necessary-

From: Daniel T [mailto:enquiry@afcars.com.sq]

Sent: Friday, 11 June, 2021 11:56 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLW 4098D DATE OF ACCIDENT : 11/04/21

Hi Rasul,
Noted with thanks.
Confirmed.

Sent from my iPhone



On 9Jun 2021, at 12:20 PM, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Brandon,

Refer to attachment

Some of the parts prices required audit check. Need to be adjusted.
The Finalised amount is $ 5,500 / 7 days of lump sum repair

Kindly reply on acceptance

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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