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From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: 9 April, 2021 3:23 PM

To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; 'auburnauto@gmail.com'

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3070H & SLW6166C ON 8 APRIL 2021 AT 13:10Hrs 

[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Our Ref        : 21/21/21/VP05/024427 

 
Dear Nivitha/Summer, 

 
FYA 

 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

 
From: Daniel Mak [mailto:mak.auburnauto@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 9 April 2021 3:09 pm 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3070H & SLW6166C ON 8 APRIL 2021 AT 13:10Hrs [External General] 

 

Hi Gerald, 

 

Kindly arrange for below to come for the pre-repair survey, thanks. 

7 Steve Chen- LKK 

 

with regards 

Mak 

Auburn Auto Pte Ltd 

+65 9773 6360 

 

On Fri, 9 Apr 2021 at 15:05, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote: 

Lonpac External - General 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Our Ref: 21/21/21/VP05/024427 

  

Dear Daniel, 

  

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and  append below our list of Motor 

surveyors for your attention:- 

    

1 Nicholas Tey–Appraisal   

2 Jackson Quek – Appraisal 

3 Joshua Ong - Appraisal 

4 Lim Teow Guan - LKK 

5 Marcus Chua - LKK 

6 Kenneth Kong- LKK 

7 Steve Chen- LKK 

8 Mohd Taufik - LKK 

9 Adrian Ling–LKK 

10 Mohd Rasul - LKK 

  

Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days. 

  

Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 



3

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

  

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 

  

From: Daniel Mak [mailto:mak.auburnauto@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 9 April 2021 2:55 pm 

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3070H & SLW6166C ON 8 APRIL 2021 AT 13:10Hrs 

  

Dear Officer-In-Charge, 

  
We refer to the above. 

  
We are handling the claims for our client’s car: 
[SJE3070H] 
  

  
The car is currently at:  

176 Sin Ming Drive, 

Sin Ming Auto Care 

#04-18 AUBURN AUTO 

  
The other party is [SLW6166C].  

  
We would like to amicably settle this directly with you.  

  
In this regard, we would appreciate it if you could list your surveyors list for us to choose to inspect the car 

before our repair.  

  
Thank you.  

  
*Kindly call Mak -97736360(hp) to make an Appointment 


