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FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3070H & SLW6166C ON 8 APRIL 2021 AT 13:10Hrs
[External Confidential]

Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Tue 6/15/2021 1:02 PM
To:  GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

2 attachments (2 MB)
S21061418281.pdf; Scan2021-06-15_123150.pdf;

Dear Gerald,
 
Thank you for the email.
 
 
Dear CS Department,
 
Kindly follow up on direct settlement.
 
 
 
  
 
Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
 
 
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com] 

Sent: Tuesday, 15 June 2021 12:58 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Daniel Mak <mak.auburnauto@gmail.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3070H & SLW6166C ON 8 APRIL 2021 AT 13:10Hrs [External Confidential]
 
Lonpac External - Confidential
 
Our Ref        : 21/21/21/VP05/024427
 
Dear Veron,
 
Kindly revert to them on Direct Settlement.
 
Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
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300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

 
 
In view of the latest “Heightened Alert” on COVID-19 measures, more than 50% of our
staff will be working from home from 17 May to 13 June 2021. Please expect delays in our
replies during this period. Your understanding is greatly appreciated and we apologise for
any inconvenience caused.
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.
 
From: Daniel Mak [mailto:mak.auburnauto@gmail.com] 

Sent: Tuesday, 15 June 2021 12:53 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE3070H & SLW6166C ON 8 APRIL 2021 AT 13:10Hrs
 
Hi Lonpac,
 
This is the LOD as requested.
 
Attached is also the police report with the investigation result.
 
Kindly revert to settle the case amicably.
 
 
with regards
Mak
Auburn Auto Pte Ltd
+65 9773 6360
 

https://www.lonpac.com.sg/
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