Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 June 2021 4:30 pm

To: Ng Mei Yen; Admin A

Cc: Stephanie Loke; Ronald Yap; Sonia Teo; Tommy Woon Wui Tew; Shiau Chan
(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REMINDER : TP SMX5371R FINALIZE

Dear Mei Yen,

Confirmed COR $9508.6 before GST @ 5 days.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

From: Ng Mei Yen [mailto:meiyen.ng@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 31 May, 2021 11:37 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Stephanie Loke; Ronald Yap; Sonia Teo; Tommy Woon Wui Tew
Subject: REMINDER : TP SMX5371R FINALIZE

Dear Guo Qiang,

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.
COR: $9,509.60 before GST & Excess
05 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible

Best Regards

Mei Yen

Customer Service Coordinator

27A, Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

Email: meiyen.ng@eurokars.com.sg
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From: Ng Mei Yen

Sent: 27 May 2021 4:44 PM

To: guogiang@I|kkauto.com

Cc: Stephanie Loke <stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Sonia Teo
<sonia.teo@eurokars.com.sg>; Tommy Woon Wui Tew <tommy.woon@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: TP SLMX5371R FINALIZE

Dear Guo Qiang,

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.
COR: $9,509.60 before GST & Excess
05 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)
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Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible

Best Regards

Mei Yen

Customer Service Coordinator

27A, Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

Email: meiyen.ng@eurokars.com.sg
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