Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 April 2021 4:39 PM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto); Team AutoPro

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Finalization of COR: GBK 4718 E /DOA 24/03/2021
Dear John,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed $ 650 and 03 Repair Days

Kindly send invoice and all supporting documents directly to AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD, ref no: SIMO36FR

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 April 2021 7:43 AM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com>; Team AutoPro <tap.finalization@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: Finalization of COR: GBK 4718 E /DOA 24/03/2021

Dear Mr Lim,

Kindly assist on the finalize.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Team AutoPro <tap.finalization@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 16 April 2021 2:33 PM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@l|kkauto.com>
Subject: Finalization of COR: GBK 4718 E /DOA 24/03/2021

Gd Day,

Without Prejudice




Thank You for assisting as SJE for subject vehicle

Attach with marked estimate and after marked estimate amount

Parts After Discount -S0
Special Netts -$50
Labour -$ 600

Sub Total ( Parts + S/N + Labour) - S 650

Part by part - $ 650 and 03 Repair Days

Enclosed herewith after-repair photos FYN.

Look forward to your favorable reply .
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

John Ko

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
HP : 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



