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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

Sent: Tuesday, 28 September 2021 5:31 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise SJJ1001U BMW M3

Dear Veron, 

We shall accept the final amount at $27,013.00 before GST 8 days. 

 

 

Thank you & Best regards 

 

Alvin Koh | Claims Advisor 

 
T 6262 8888 | F 6452 5333 | M 8138 7188 

Email: alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02 

Sin Ming AutoCity • Singapore 575722 

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 28 September 2021 5:06 PM 

To: alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

Subject: Finalise SJJ1001U BMW M3 

 

Dear Alvin, 

 

We have check with AIG OIC , the below items are not insured. 

 

1) FRONT WINDSCREEN SOLAR FILM (V-KOOL) 

2) FRONT DOOR GLASS SOLAR FILE (V-KOOL) 

 

Please check and confirmed Final amount $27,013 @ 8 days (subject to insurance approval). 

 

 

 

 
Best Regards, 
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Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg [mailto:alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 28 September 2021 9:44 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Finalise SJJ1001U BMW M3 

 

Dear Veron, 

Please find attached documents as requested. 

 

 

Thank you & Best regards 

 

Alvin Koh | Claims Advisor 

 
T 6262 8888 | F 6452 5333 | M 8138 7188 

Email: alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02 

Sin Ming AutoCity • Singapore 575722 

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

 

 

 

 

 

From: alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg <alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 6 August 2021 4:38 PM 

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Danny Ong' <danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>; 'shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg' 

<shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalise SJJ1001U BMW M3 

 

Dear Kenneth, 

Please find attached supplier invoices and help to finalise the COR at Part By Part at $27,483.00 before GST. 

 

 

 

Thank you & Best regards 
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Alvin Koh | Claims Advisor 

 
T 6262 8888 | F 6452 5333 | M 8138 7188 

Email: alvin.koh@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02 

Sin Ming AutoCity • Singapore 575722 

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

 

 

 

 


