Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 July 2021 2:51 PM

To: Boo seng yak; Nora Khai

Cc: SUR; Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SKC9071P - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 APR 21

Dear Mr Boo,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm final fig $15,121.52 before excess $2,000.00 & GST and 7 repair days.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us close case.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 June 2021 6:03 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Nora Khai <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: Fwd: FINAL REVISION - SKC9071P - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 APR 21

Hi Shiau Chan,
As per your request today, please find attached finalisation for above vehicle sent to you on 15 Jun 21.

Please check and let us know if it is in proper hands.

Best regards - Johnny Boo

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, Jun 15, 2021 at 4:52 PM

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SKC9071P - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 APR 21

To: Adrian Ling <adrianling@I|kkauto.com>, Shiau Chan <siewsc@lkkauto.com>, SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>, Carrine
Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>, <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg>, Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

hl aDRIAN AND ALL,
Revised estimate, re-survey docs and photographs is attached.
Please confirm repair cost of $15,121.52 7 days exclude 1 Sunday & 1 PH.

Your early closure is well appreciated.



Best regards -- Johnny Boo



