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Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: motorclaims@ltm.sg

Sent: Monday, 12 April 2021 2:55 pm

To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR; venus@ltm.sg; mandy@ltm.sg

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle SDH 9200 R / DOA: 30.03.2021 / Finalization Acceptance

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Hui Zhen 

 

We accept your finalization offer  COR at P/P $1,681.60, 02 repair days. 

 

Please advise to whom we send our LOD. 

 

Thank you and regards, 

 

Mr Leong 

Motor Claims Dept 

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 

 

www. LTM.sg 

+65 6452 0893 (Office) 

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 

 

Like us in Facebook!! 

www.facebook.com/LTMsg 

www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) [mailto:huizhen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, April 12, 2021 2:12 PM 

To: motorclaims@ltm.sg; venus@ltm.sg; mandy@ltm.sg 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle SDH 9200 R / DOA: 30.03.2021 / Finalization Pending 

 

Hi Mr Leong, 

 

Revised COR at P/P $1,681.60, 02 repair days. 

 

Please confirm. 

 
Best Regards, 

Hui Zhen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: huizhen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: motorclaims@ltm.sg <motorclaims@ltm.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 9 April, 2021 9:55 AM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; 'Mandy Lim' <mandy@ltm.sg> 

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle SDH 9200 R / DOA: 30.03.2021 / Finalization Pending 
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Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Kenneth, 

 

Please find attached before paint photos to revise repair basis to P/P. 

 

Please confirm your finalization offer at P/P $1,701.84 02 repair days. 

 

Please let us have the contact details of the claims officer in charge. 

 

Thank you and regards, 

 

Mr Leong 

Motor Claims Dept 

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 

 

www. LTM.sg 

+65 6452 0893 (Office) 

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 

 

Like us in Facebook!! 

www.facebook.com/LTMsg 

www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Summer (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, April 6, 2021 5:07 PM 

To: motorclaims@ltm.sg 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com; 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; 'Mandy Lim' <mandy@ltm.sg> 

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle SDH 9200 R 

 

Dear Leong, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 

#02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: motorclaims@ltm.sg <motorclaims@ltm.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 6 April, 2021 4:50 PM 

To: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com; 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg>; 'Mandy Lim' <mandy@ltm.sg> 

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle SDH 9200 R 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Summer, 

 

Vehicle will be in the workshop on 07.04.2021 after 1000hrs. Pleased note the vehicle number is SDH 9200 R. 

 

Thank you and regards, 

 

Leong 

Motor Claims Dept 

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 

 

www. LTM.sg 

+65 6452 0893 (Office) 

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 

 

Like us in Facebook!! 

www.facebook.com/LTMsg 

www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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From: Summer (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, April 6, 2021 4:22 PM 

To: motorclaims@ltm.sg 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: Survey Vehicle SDH 200R 

 

 

Dear Mr Leong, 

 

Is the vehicle SDH 200R in the workshop? 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 

#02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 


