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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 1 June 2021 4:37 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SLP7899B--Finalised

Attachments: SLP7899B--Finalised.pdf; SLP7899B--Supplier.pdf

Front grille serviceable. 

 

From: Operation / Candy Ong <operation@tlauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 1 June 2021 1:02 pm 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SLP7899B--Finalised 

 
Hi Kenneth, 

 

Please find attached supplier’s invoices for your attention and finalization  

 

Kindly revert  

 

Best Regards, 

Candy Ong  

Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd 

 

 

 


