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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 July 2021 11:34 AM

To: Brian Eng Kwok Long

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise GBH 101 B

Attachments: GBH101B_21072021.pdf; SUPPLIER INV-INSCO.pdf; GBH 101B(SUPPL).pdf

Hi Brian, 

 

Finalised amount of $ 24,547.07 / 14 days of P/P repair is confirmed 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long [mailto:EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 26 July, 2021 9:55 AM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Ramesh 
Subject: Re: Finalise GBH 101 B 

 
Hi Rasul , 

 

Please refer to the attached. 

 

Thanks 

 
NOTICE: 
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected. 
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 

 

Brian Eng Kwok Long | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m: +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 19 July 2021 4:02 PM 
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To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalise GBH 101 B  
  
Reminder 2 
 
Hi Rasul, 
  
Kindly assist finalise the amount @ $24397.07 
  
Thanks & Best Regards, 
 
NOTICE: 
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected. 
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 

 

Brian Eng Kwok Long | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m: +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 15 July 2021 6:01 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: Finalise GBH 101 B  
  
Reminder 1 
 

Hi Rasul, 
  
Kindly assist finalise the amount @ $24397.07 
  
Thanks & Best Regards, 
 

 
NOTICE: 
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected. 
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 

 

Brian Eng Kwok Long | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m: +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 
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From: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 9 July 2021 8:41 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Finalise GBH 101 B  
  
Hi Rasul 
  
Kindly assist finalise the amount @ $24397.07 
  
Thanks & Best Regards, 
 
NOTICE: 
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected. 
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 

 

Brian Eng Kwok Long | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m: +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

From: Soo Leong Keat <SooLeongKeat@goldbell.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 8 July 2021 9:40 AM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Finalise GBH 101 B  
  
Dear Surveyor Rasul 

  

As your request, please file attached photos. 

  

The rest photos you had take before paint photos. 

  

Kindly assist for the finalize. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

  

Regards, 

  
NOTICE: 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be 
expected for handling hardcopy documents.  
All correspondence should be made via email instead. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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Soo Leong Keat | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

DID:  | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax:  | 
Mobile: +65 9755 7336 |  

   

 
  

  

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, July 7, 2021 6:32:21 PM 

To: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Finalise GBH 101 B  

  

Hi Brian, 
  
Request for the photos from junior until now no action 
  
  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long [mailto:EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 July, 2021 3:29 PM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

Cc: ramesh@goldbell.com 
Subject: Finalise GBH 101 B 
  
Hi Rasul 
  
Kindly assist finalise the amount @ $24397.07 
  
Thanks & Best Regards, 
  
NOTICE: 
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected. 
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 
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Brian Eng Kwok Long | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m: +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long 

Sent: Wednesday, 30 June 2021 10:18 AM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalise GBH 101 B  
  
Hi Rasul 
  
Kindly assist finalise the amount @ $24397.07 
  
Photo I will be sent separately as files size too big. 
  
Thanks & Best Regards, 
  
NOTICE: 
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected. 
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us! 

 

Brian Eng Kwok Long | Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 

Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

 

 

t:  | m: +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator 


