Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 31 May 2021 4:43 PM
To: Brian Eng Kwok Long

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Finalise GBF 6171 U

Hi Brian,

Finalised and repair limit amount of $ 29,000.00(29K) / 14 days of lump sum repair is confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

SERER WWT Swve the Larthe Print only whernr necessary-

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long [mailto:EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 27 May, 2021 12:38 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Ramesh

Subject: Re: Finalise GBF 6171 U

Hi Rasul

Kindly refer to the amended audatex report

Thanks & Best Regards,

NOTICE:
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected.
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us!

|
GOLDBELL Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

coss. ENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services.
41,000 Served. And Counting. | +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 22 May 2021 8:39 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: Finalise GBF 6171 U




Reminder 2

Hi Rasul & Shiau Chan

Kindly assist finalise the amount L/S limit $29k for this case at soonest.
Thanks & Best Regards,

NOTICE:
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected.
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us!

|
GOLDBELL Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

cossn ENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services.
41,000 Served, And Counting. | +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 May 2021 11:46 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: Finalise GBF 6171 U

Reminder

Hi Rasul & Shiau Chan

Kindly assist finalise the amount L/S limit $29k for this case.

Thanks & Best Regards,

NOTICE:
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected.
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us!

GOLDBELL Goldbell Engineering Plte Ltd

comse. CENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services.
41,000 Served, And Counting. | +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 2:50 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: Finalise GBF 6171 U

Hi Rasul & Shiau Chan



Can we finalise the amount L/S limit $29k for this case.

Thanks & Best Regards,

NOTICE:
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected.
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us!

|
GOLDBELL Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

cossn ENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services.
41,000 Served. And Counting. | +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long

Sent: Thursday, 29 April 2021 3:38 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: Finalise GBF 6171 U

Hi Rasul,
Can we finalise the amount L/S limit $29k for this case.

Aside to Shiau Chan
| had sent the audatex to LKK

Thanks & Best Regards,

NOTICE:
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected.
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us!

|
GOLDBELL Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

cossn ENGINEERING

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services.
41,000 Served. And Counting. | +65 9739 7127 | f: +65 6863 0425 | w: www.goldbell.com.sg

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator



