Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Daniel Mak <mak.auburnauto@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 30 April, 2021 4:19 PM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SLQ 9175M

Hi Sun Pin,

The company accepts the amount.

To whom do I send the LOD to?

with regards

Mak

Auburn Auto Pte Ltd
+65 9773 6360

On Thu, 29 Apr 2021 at 15:55, Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Daniel,

Kindly refer the finalize amount $1,650. Repair day 3 days. (L/S, before gst).

Please confirm the COR by reply email.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



