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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 June 2021 11:00 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJQ 1734 B TOYOTA VIOS -----------------FINALIZE

 

hi  
 

accept and closes at $$4100.00 and  6day 
 

 

 

On Jun 16, 2021 at 10:15 AM, <Denise Tay (LKKAuto)> wrote: 

Dear Xiong, 

  

Can we confirm the finalise amount? 

  
$ 4,100 / 6 days of lump sum repair 

  

  
  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 11 June 2021 1:59 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SJQ 1734 B TOYOTA VIOS -----------------FINALIZE 

  

Dear Xiong, 

  

Can we confirm the finalise amount? 

  
$ 4,100 / 6 days of lump sum repair 

  

Best Regards, 
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Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 8 June 2021 12:18 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: SJQ 1734 B TOYOTA VIOS -----------------FINALIZE  

  

  

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 8 June 2021 12:18:15 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 

To: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> 
Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SJQ 1734 B TOYOTA VIOS -----------------FINALIZE 

Dear Xiong,  

  

Can we confirm the finalise amount? 

  
$ 4,100 / 6 days of lump sum repair 

  
Thanks and regards,  

Denise 

Case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Tel: ℡ 62563561 Fax: � 6256 4315 
Email:  sur@lkkauto.com 

  

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 28 May 2021 8:54 AM 

To: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> 

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SJQ 1734 B TOYOTA VIOS -----------------FINALIZE  

  

Dear Xiong, 

  

Can we confirm the finalise amount? 

  
$ 4,100 / 6 days of lump sum repair 

  
Thanks and regards,  
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Denise 

Case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Tel: ℡ 62563561 Fax: � 6256 4315 
Email:  sur@lkkauto.com 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 25 May 2021 8:55 AM 

To: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> 

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SJQ 1734 B TOYOTA VIOS -----------------FINALIZE  

  

Hi Xiong, 

  

Refer to attachment 

Finalised amount is $ 4,100 / 6 days of lump sum repair 

  

  
Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
1
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From: Rico 60 Claims [mailto:claims@rico60.com]  

Sent: Saturday, 15 May, 2021 8:10 AM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Rico 60 Enquiry 

Subject: Re: SJQ 1734 B TOYOTA VIOS -----------------FINALIZE 

  
Hi lkk, 
  
Reminder finalize 
  
Kindly assist us to finalize this case. 

  

Regards, 

xiong 

  

  
To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

Email: claims@rico60.com 
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On Sat, May 8, 2021 at 8:17 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote: 

HI LKK, 

  

reminder finalize 

  

Regards, 

xiong 

  

  
To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

Email: claims@rico60.com 

  

  

On Thu, Apr 29, 2021 at 12:51 PM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote: 

hi Rasul, 

  

Kindly assist us to finalize this case. 

  

Regards, 

xiong 
To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

Email: claims@rico60.com 

  

  

On Sat, Apr 17, 2021 at 8:35 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote: 

Rasul  
  
Attached is the after paint photos for your reference. 
  
Kindly assist us to finalize this case. 
  

  

Regards, 

XIONG 
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To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

#02-24, Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 

Email: claims@rico60.com 


