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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 4 May 2021 1:28 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Lauro Araos Songcuan JR
Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Jojo Cheng; Edwin Abcede Caina
Subject: RE: AIG Ref: 3426835712SG-003 (SLV1391G)     Our Ref: SMQ3525P     DOA: 

13/03/2021

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
PD LOD uploaded into Merimen for your handling.  
 
Please assist to revert to Larry.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Loh Chee Heng 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1881 
Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com | www.AIG.sg 
  
If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, I do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you. 
 

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 May 2021 10:31 AM 
To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jojo 
Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] AIG Ref: 3426835712SG-003 (SLV1391G) Our Ref: SMQ3525P DOA: 13/03/2021 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Loh Chee Heng, 
 
Pls. refer to attached LOD. 
 
Our customer, Ragupathy S/O Narayanamoorthy insured with NTUC claims as follows. 
 
Cost of repair                     $ 4,102.81 
Loss of rental                     $    385.20   ($128.40 x 3 days) 
GIA search fee                   $        2.00 
                                              -------------- 
Total                                    $ 4,490.01 
 
Appreciate if you could quantify your offer of settlement the soonest. 
 
Thank you so much. 
 
 
Best regards, 
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Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 
 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 19 April 2021 09:30 PM 
To: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jojo 
Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Admin A 
<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SMQ3525P (MIT) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG) 
 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Hi Larry/Hsiao Tong, 
 
We confirm the finalize $3834.40 (P/P, before GST). 3 repair days. 
 
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 19 April 2021 10:32 AM 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jojo 
Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: SMQ3525P (MIT) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG)  
  
Dear Steve, 
  
Pls. refer to attached files and photos. 
  
Kindly confirm finalized amount of $ 3,834.40 before Gst. 
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Thank you so much. 
  
  
Best regards, 
  
Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
  
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  
  
  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd 
and/or any of its related corporations.  
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 12 April 2021 2:46 PM
To: jon_chincc@hotmail.com
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV 1391G(AIG) AND SMQ 3525P AT/ALONG BUKIT MANIS 

RD OPEN SPACE CARPARK ON 13/03/2021

12 April 2021 
                                                                
Mr Chin Che Chung                                                                  [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SLV1391G 
Our Ref: CC4/AIG21004350/Epa3               
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV 1391G(AIG) AND SMQ 3525P AT/ALONG BUKIT MANIS RD OPEN SPACE CARPARK ON 
13/03/2021 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SMQ3525P against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour as your 
vehicle had collided onto third party parled vehicle. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable 
settlement with the Third Party. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
17 Mar
2021
14:06

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(202779) MITSUBISHI OUTLANDER 2.0 (A). [I] Fan,
Winnie-LW

2
17 Mar
2021
14:06

Clm Created
Reg No: SMQ3525P. Policy No: 1700090614. Acct Date: 2021/03/13. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asi
a Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG). Workshop: Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd (Pandan Gardens).
Ins.Status => Incoming Claim

[I] Fan,
Winnie-LW

3
17 Mar
2021
14:06

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (E
xpress)

[I] Merimen
Administrator

4
24 Mar
2021
08:54

Clm
Registration
Modified

Acct Time:00:00:00->19:00:00. Pol No:1700090614->1700090614-02.

[I] AIG
OneClaim

Integration
User

5
06 Apr
2021
16:34

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [I] Chin, Lee-

Ying

6
06 Apr
2021
16:34

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/04/15 [I] Chin, Lee-
Ying

7
06 Apr
2021
16:34

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [I] Chin, Lee-
Ying

8
06 Apr
2021
16:37

Assignment
1st
Accessed

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

9
06 Apr
2021
16:37

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> CHEN TSUE YEE [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
06 Apr
2021
16:37

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
07 Apr
2021
08:46

Clm
Registration
Modified

Pol No:1700090614-02->1700090614. [I] Low,
Xianyu

12
28 Apr
2021
17:12

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

13
04 May
2021
13:44

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:4490.01:Liability: 100%(B22) *Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $4,102.81 + (b)LORw/GST(3days x
$120.00): $385.20 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $2.00= Total: $4,490.01 *3 recommendation repair days
*For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

14
04 May
2021
13:47

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/04/15 [I] Loh, Chee-
Heng

15
04 May
2021
13:47

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:4490.01. [I] Loh, Chee-
Heng

Date From    Date To    Audit Type None Go

 
ACTIVITY
No record

 
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2678180 17 Mar 2021
14:10:41 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SMQ3525P Fan, Winnie-
LW xx.xx

2678186 17 Mar 2021
14:18:03

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SMQ3525P CHIN CHE
CHUNG xx.xx

2690123 28 Apr 2021
17:12:08

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SMQ3525P SLV1391G 11.00

 
 

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=84468625&CFTOKEN=121eb6dfad001aaf-212E24DF-B849-DC75-31CDA88270DCEBF8&USID=3251&RID=7675396
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=84468625&CFTOKEN=121eb6dfad001aaf-212E24DF-B849-DC75-31CDA88270DCEBF8&USID=3251&RID=7675396
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=84468625&CFTOKEN=121eb6dfad001aaf-212E24DF-B849-DC75-31CDA88270DCEBF8&USID=3251&RID=7675396
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=84468625&CFTOKEN=121eb6dfad001aaf-212E24DF-B849-DC75-31CDA88270DCEBF8&USID=3251&RID=7675396&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D995518%26extid%3D359424%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=84468625&CFTOKEN=121eb6dfad001aaf-212E24DF-B849-DC75-31CDA88270DCEBF8&USID=3251&RID=7675396
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