Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: August 26, 2021 4:25 PM

To: Stina Chen; Dhanya B.Purushothaman

Cc: Celyn Lim; Admin A

Subject: Accident involving FBQ 9739E and SLM 9784B on the 02/04/2021 / MFL2021D0001412
Dear Dhanya,

TP informed us that they have engaged lawyer for this case. We will proceed to close file from our end and
submit the survey report to you.

Aside to Stina,
There will no private settlement on this.
Thanks

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Stina Chen [mailto:stina.chen@grab.com]

Sent: July 8, 2021 10:01 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Celyn Lim <celyn.lim@grab.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [External] Accident involving FBQ 9739E and SLM 9784B on the 02/04/2021

Hi Jasper
Pls proceed handle at best term

Thanks.

LGB




Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: huaho trading <huahotrading@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: August 26, 2021 3:31 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Discharge Voucher / Your ref : FBQ 9739E

Dear Jasper,
For this case, we have already engage a solicitor.
Thank you!

Best Regards
Hua Ho Trading

On Wednesday, 25 August 2021, 08:47:21 PM SGT, Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Jane,

Please ignore the email dated 08 July 2021.

Our insured (GRAB) would like to do private settlement for this. They propose a settlement at a global sum of
$2,050.00(all-in).

Kindly confirm acceptance by duly sign the mutual settlement enclosed.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention
of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should
be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence
on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Jasper Chua| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: July 8, 2021 10:31 AM

To: huaho trading <huahotrading@yahoo.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Discharge Voucher / Your ref : FBQ 9739E

Without Prejudice

Dear Jane,

Thank you for your email.

Our insured (GRAB) would like to do private settlement for this. They propose a settlement at a global sum of
$2,050.00(all-in).



Kindly confirm acceptance by duly sign the mutual settlement enclosed.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention
of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should
be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence
on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Jasper Chua| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: huaho trading <huahotrading@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 30 June 2021 3:27 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Discharge Voucher / Your ref : FBQ 9739E

Dear Jasper,

Attached for your perusal

Thank you!

On Wednesday, 30 June 2021, 03:26:34 PM SGT, huaho trading <huahotrading@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Jasper,
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