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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 14 December 2021 17:21
To: Eva Kok Wai Kee; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Stephanie Loke; Jobi Thomas; Jess Francis Carlos; Tan Wei Cin; Admin A; Falcoe Lee 

Weng Fai
Subject: RE: LOD - Accident involving vehicle SMK911J & XD5915Y ( LONPAC ) DOA : 

30/03/2021 *** LKK REF; CC4/LPC21004335/R1ea3

From: Ng Mei Yen  
Sent: 05 October 2021 10:56 AM 
To: jasperchua@lkkauto.com; Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com) <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Stephanie Loke <stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Jobi Thomas <jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg>; Jess Francis 
Carlos <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>; Tan Wei Cin <weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg> 
Subject: LOD - Accident involving vehicle SMK911J & XD5915Y ( LONPAC ) DOA : 30/03/2021 
 
Dear Claims Officer, 
 
The repairs have been completed for SMK911J. We submit the following claims with supporting 

documents for your perusal:- 

 

1) Invoice No. 30021628 $53,500.00 
2) Loss of Rental  ( $70 x 2 days  )                 $149.80 

3) Loss of Usage  ( $120 x 33 days  )              $3,960.00 

3) LTA/GIA Search Fees                  $2.00 

4) Door Solar Film            $100.00 

5) 3D Chrome Number Plate  $110.00 

6) Sticker Moulding ( Chrome )             $440.00 

7) Letter of Authorization  

8) Discharge Voucher  

Please pay $58,261.80 to Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd  $58,261.80 

 
We look forward to receiving your offer/Discharge Voucher soon 
 
Best Regards 
Mei Yen 
Customer Service Coordinator 
27A, Tanjong Penjuru  
Singapore 609042 
Email: meiyen.ng@eurokars.com.sg 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: Monday, 7 March 2022 18:01
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/02438 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 

5915Y AND SMK 911J ON 30/03/2021

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Asher  
 
Please proceed as recommended.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
“In view of the revised measures for transition under Phase 2 COVID-19 restrictions effective 
19 August 2021, 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in our 
replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding is greatly 
appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused”. 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 4 March 2022 2:12 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Ong Li Li Forwarded Mail <llong@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/02438 // ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 5915Y AND SMK 911J ON 
30/03/2021 
 
Your Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/02438 
 
Dear Sirs, 
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We refer to the above matter. 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 5915Y AND SMK 911J ON 30/03/2021 
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 06/04/2021 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal, 
Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
 
The accident occurred when our insured hit third party behind and turn 180 degree. 
 
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD is as follows: - 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 73,310.19 $ 53,500.00 
2. Loss of Rental (2days x $70)(w/GST) $      149.80 $      149.80 (2days x $70) 
3. Loss of Use (33days x $110) $   3,960.00 $   3,300.00 (33days x $100) 
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $          2.00 
5. Disbursement $      650.00 $      650.00 

Total $ 78,071.99 $ 57,601.80   

 
**20 days recommendation for repair. 
 
 

Market Value $100,000 

LTA Rebate $45,351 

Nett Value $54,649 

 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
The above is for your approval please. 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 


