Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Vincent Lim <vince.nsst@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 April 2021 5:11 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDF 556J) / SMQ 2631Y / OTHERS ALONG/AT PIE TOWARDS

TUAS ON 01/04/2021

Hi Jaslin

| believed | have also furnished info on the unsolicited car that came by offering workshop services, car number plate
and Co. Info is in the report | made at the authorised worksop at Lai Huat.

Kindly refer to that, | have no other info | could offer you.

Brgds
Vince

Sent from my Huawei phone

———————— Original message --------

From: "Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)" <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Date: Tue, 6 Apr 2021, 3:19 pm

To: vince.nsst@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDF 556) / SMQ 2631Y / OTHERS ALONG/AT PIE TOWARDS TUAS ON 01/04/2021

Our Ref: CC4/A1G21004309/ra3

LIM SERN HWEE - BY EMAIL ONLY

[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDF 556] / SMQ 2631Y / OTHERS ALONG/AT PIE TOWARDS TUAS ON
01/04/2021



We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed
by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against
your policy.

We have received a claim from SMQ 2631Y against your motor insurance policy.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of
your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

We notice that you reported about a possible stage accident as well as unsolicited assistance at the
scene etc. Kindly let us have for more information / evidences.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) will be with held for the time being.
Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

(Motor Claims Dept)

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



