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Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 20 April, 2021 11:22 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Reminder : Finalization for PC9332C

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Please proceed.  
 
On Mon, Apr 19, 2021 at 4:52 PM Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Winnie, 

  

Kindly refer the finalize amount $12,250. Repair day 10 days. (L/S, before gst). 

  

Please confirm the COR by reply email. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 

  

LKK Auto Consultants 

  

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com]  

Sent: Monday, 19 April, 2021 2:51 PM 
To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) 

Subject: Reminder : Finalization for PC9332C 

  

Hi Sun Pin  
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Pls kindly revert on the finalization for this case. 

  

Thanks  

  

On Wed, Apr 14, 2021 at 10:33 AM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Sun Pin 

  

Attached is the after repair photos. 

  

Pls kindly revert on the finalization. 

  

Thanks  
 

  

--  

Winnie Chai 

Connect3 

HP:9850-9666 

 
 

  

--  

Winnie Chai 

Connect3 

HP:9850-9666 

 
 
 
--  
Winnie Chai 
Connect3 
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HP:9850-9666 


