4/2/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Your ref: EY 928H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 2017S (Ol) & EY 928H (TP) ON 18/06/2016

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Fri 2/4/2021 1:20 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

0 1 attachments (611 KB)
DS FORM_EY928H.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably

without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages,

either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 March 2021 9:13 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: EY 928H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 2017S (Ol) & EY 928H (TP) ON 18/06/2016

Hi Hsiao Tong

Offer accepted ,send us DV please thank you .
Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2021 5:08 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Subject: RE: Your ref: EY 928H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 2017S (Ol) & EY 928H (TP) ON 18/06/2016

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs,
We refer to your below email.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) [ $6,527.00
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2. Loss of Use (8days x $150.00) $1,200.00
Total | $7,727.00

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably

without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages,
either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 10:25 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: EY 928H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 2017S (Ol) & EY 928H (TP) ON 18/06/2016

Hi Hsiao Tong
We will like to propose loss of use is $160 per day as our client vehicle is Porsche . kindly revise the offer thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, December 09, 2017 12:59 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com; 'alanauto@gmail.com' <alanauto@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: EY 928H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 2017S (Ol) & EY 928H (TP) ON 18/06/2016

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 6,527.00
2. Loss of Use (8days x $100.00) $ 800.00
Total | $7,327.00

Please confirm acceptance.
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“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an admission of liability on
our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other
related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nur Syafigah (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 10 February, 2017 5:22 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Nur Syafigah (LKKAuto)
<NurSyafigah@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: EY 928H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 2017S (Ol) & EY 928H (TP) ON 18/06/2016

‘Without Prejudice’

Dear Kenny,

Refer to the email below.

Kindly let us have the Purchase Order (PO) asap, for our necessary action.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Best Regards,
Syaf | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-5792 | email: NurSyafigah@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

AesmE= =W Save the Earthe Print only when necessary-

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender immediately and

destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Nur Syafigah (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 January, 2017 12:01 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Nur Syafigah (LKKAuto)
<NurSyafigah@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref: EY 928H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 2017S (OI) & EY 928H (TP) ON 18/06/2016

‘Without Prejudice’

Dear Kenny,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 2017S (OI) & EY 928H (TP) ON 18/06/2016

We refer to the above matter.

As per our tele-conversation, kindly let us have the Purchase Order (PO) asap, for our necessary action.

Thankyou.
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“Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year”

Best Regards,

Syaf | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-5792 | email: NurSyafiqgah@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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