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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 10:29 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Goh, Jeremy

Cc: Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: AIG Ref: #0492098602SG003#027# || Accident between SMT 7613 B and SGG 

4991 T and SMU 520 B on 27 Mar 2021 *** LKK REF: CS/AIG21004136/R1vf3e2

Dear Jeremy, 

 

 

TP workshop is pursuing the claim  

 

They had engaged lawyer to handle the TP claim. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 9:39 AM 

To: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: AIG Ref: #0492098602SG003#027# || Accident between SMT 7613 B and SGG 4991 T and SMU 520 B 

on 27 Mar 2021 *** LKK REF: CS/AIG21004136/R1vf3e2 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

 

Hi Veron, 

 

Kindly assist. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Goh, Jeremy <Jeremy.Goh@aig.com>  

Sent: Saturday, 8 May, 2021 11:40 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: AIG Ref: #0492098602SG003#027# || Accident between SMT 7613 B and SGG 4991 T and SMU 520 B on 27 

Mar 2021 

 

Dear LKK team,  

 

Can I check if the TPWS is intending to pursue the claim?  

 

Will there be a Direct Settlement? 

 

Regards 

Jeremy Goh 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.  
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1767 
Jeremy.goh@aig.com  |  www.AIG.com.sg 
 
If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, I do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you. 

 

 


