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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 5:38 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB2959T AND SLF808M AT BLK874 TAMPINES ST 84 

CARPARK ON 22/03/2021 @1525HRS *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG21004061/pa3

Good day Hsiao Tong, 
 
My client has manage to private settle the issue with the third party hence we are withdrawing the case. 
Thank you for your time. 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, 9 April 2021 10:17 AM 
To: 'John Tee' <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB2959T AND SLF808M AT BLK874 TAMPINES ST 84 CARPARK ON 22/03/2021 
@1525HRS *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG21004061/pa3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that both parties should exercise caution for this matter. Your 
client was adjusting his parking position after stopped for 1-2seconds while our insured driver opened the door. 
Thus collision happened. The damages to our insured door was being pulled outward which is likely that our door 
was opened while your client was moving ahead.  
  
We propose 50/50 towards your client’s claim as per MAG S30(b). 
  
Please confirm acceptance and arrange for survey. Thanks. 
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Our insured vehicle’s door damages 

 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 3:35 PM 
To: 'John Tee' <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB2959T AND SLF808M AT BLK874 TAMPINES ST 84 CARPARK ON 22/03/2021 
@1525HRS *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG21004061/pa3 
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
  

 

 
  
Please provide us the following and arrange for survey. 

 evidence i.e. video and scene photo (if any) 
 TP estimated cost of repair 

  
 Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 March, 2021 2:14 PM 

To: 'John Tee' <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB2959T AND SLF808M AT BLK874 TAMPINES ST 84 CARPARK ON 22/03/2021 

@1525HRS 
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Dear Sir / Mdm, 

  
Thank you for your assignment. 

  
Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 

  
  
Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 

Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

From: John Tee <ktmotorwerk@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 March, 2021 2:05 PM 

To: Assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB2959T AND SLF808M AT BLK874 TAMPINES ST 84 CARPARK ON 22/03/2021 @1525HRS 

  
To the officer in charge,  
  
We are the appointed workshop for SLB2959T. The other party SLF808M (AIG) 
  
Kindly please advise for liability first and we have attached the video footage of our client 
(SLB2959T) 
  
  
Regards,  
John Tee,  
HP:98287487 
KT MOTORWERK  
ADD: Blk 3012 Bedok Industrial Park E, #01-2020 S489978 
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