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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Wendy Tian <tianqian@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 5:33 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Michael Thong
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 808M(AIG) AND SLB 2959T AT/ALONG HDB Carpark 

between 874 Tampines St 84 and 874A Tampines St 84 ON 22/03/2021

Hi Hsiao Tong,  
 
Just let you know I have already signed private settlement form with that guy. So we 
official closed the file. And I have already informed AIG and submitted the form 
today.  
 
Thank you for all your help!  

Sent from my iPhone  
Wendy Tian 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify  
that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
 
 

On 9 Apr 2021, at 10:09, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
wrote: 

  
Hi Ms Wendy, 
  
Received with thanks. 
  
  
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  
From: Wendy Tian <tianqian@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 8 April 2021 6:17 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Michael Thong <Thong.michael@gmail.com> 
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Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 808M(AIG) AND SLB 2959T AT/ALONG HDB Carpark between 
874 Tampines St 84 and 874A Tampines St 84 ON 22/03/2021 
  
Hi Hsiao Tong,  
  
Thank you so much for your email and explaining to me about my 
accident situation. I really appreciate. Please see attached photo for your 
reference. And hopefully I can solve the problem ASAP. Please update me 
once they reply you about the 50% offer. I’ll decide what to do the next. 
<image001.jpg> 
Thanks and have a good evening! 

Sent from my iPhone  
Wendy Tian 
<~WRD0000.jpg> 
 
 
 

On 8 Apr 2021, at 09:02, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
<chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  
08 April 2021 
  
Ms Wendy Tian Qian                                                             [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
You Ref: SLF808M 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG21004061/pa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 808M(AIG) AND SLB 2959T AT/ALONG HDB Carpark 
between 874 Tampines St 84 and 874A Tampines St 84 ON 22/03/2021 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are 
the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. 
Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SLB2959T against your insurance policy. 
                
Based on all the available information on hand, we are of the view that both parties 
should exercise caution for this matter. We shall proceed to negotiate for an 
amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which 
would escalate to even more cost. 
  
If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party 
claim, kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 19/04/2021, 
after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without 
prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by 
you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular 
accident. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next 
renewal due to this Third-Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector 
feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
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Please call us if you have further queries. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  


