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Re: OD21004 SMN 64M

wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>
Thu 19/5/2022 5:53 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Dear Denise,

Enclosed as requested with many many thanks.

On Thu, May 19, 2022 at 5:43 PM wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Denise,


Enclosed as requested with many thanks.




Thanks & Regards
Tel: 6452 1493


On Tue, Mar 29, 2022 at 9:59 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:


Hi Yvonne,

as spoken. enclosed marking.

Amount at $42,773.65, 12days


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 28 March 2022 2:18 pm

To: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: OD21004 SMN 64M
 
Dear All,

Finalise at $42,773.65, 12days

Please provide discharge voucher and tax invoice for closure

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 January 2022 8:16 am

To: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: OD21004 SMN 64M
 
call me later when u come to work

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 January 2022 12:44 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: OD21004 SMN 64M
 
Denise,

Enclosed for your reference with many thanks.

Thanks & Regards
Jocelyn Lim
Tel: 6452 1493

On Tue, Dec 14, 2021 at 11:55 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Jocelyn,


how the item?


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 2 December 2021 5:40 pm

To: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: OD21004 SMN 64M
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Hi Jocelyn,


how izzit?


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 November 2021 10:56 am

To: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: OD21004 SMN 64M
 
Hi Jocelyn,


yesterday u look for me? can call me 91060645


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 October 2021 3:30 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: OD21004 SMN 64M
 
Dear Denise,


I had forwarded the above email to them. They will reply to you asap with many thanks.




Thanks & regards
Jocelyn Lim




On Tue, Oct 26, 2021 at 2:23 PM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:


Dear Jocelyn,

any updates?


Can provide part invoice?

Intercooler needs to be removed as no damage photo.
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Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 September 2021 11:53 am

To: wegaclaim@gmail.com <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: OD21004 SMN 64M
 
Dear Jocelyn,

Can provide part invoice?

Intercooler needs to be removed as no damage photo.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 20 September 2021 11:44 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: OD21004 SMN 64M
 
 
 
Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial
Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. 
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.
 
From: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com> 

Sent: Monday, 20 September, 2021 11:42 AM

To: LKK Assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: OD21004 SMN 64M
 
 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>
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Date: Tue, Jul 13, 2021 at 2:08 PM

Subject: Fwd: OD21004 SMN 64M

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: LKK Assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
 

Hi Admin ,
 
Any updates on these claims ?
 
thanks
 
 
Jocelyn 
Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd

Tel: 64521493
 
---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: wega claim <wegaclaim@gmail.com>

Date: Tue, Jun 15, 2021 at 12:01 PM

Subject: OD21004 SMN 64M

To: LKK Assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
 

Dear sir/mdm,
 
 
Enclosed are the documents for your reference with many thanks.
 
 
 
Chee Kwong
Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd

Tel: 64521493

 
--
Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd

Tel: 64521493

 
--
Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd

Tel: 64521493





-- 
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Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd

Tel: 64521493


-- 

Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd

Tel: 64521493






-- 

Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd

Tel: 64521493


-- 

Thanks & Regards,

Claim Advisor

Wega Engineering Pte Ltd

Tel: 64521493



