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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: TeamAuto Pro <teamautoffice@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 November 2021 12:12 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: syazairdina.azlan@aig.com

Subject: Re: FW: Own Damage Claim Settlement - SKH 4618U (AIG Policy# 1700076562-03 / 

DOA: 24-03-2021 (AIG REF: 9780225002SG)

Dear Veron, 
 
Fyi, we have yet to receive $150 for the towing fee. 
 
Kindly reimburse soonest so we can have this file closed on our end. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not 

prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 

injuries.* 
 

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January 2021.  

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
Cheers, 
Adel 
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6258 1955 
Fax: 6258 1956 
 
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 
 
 
 
On Fri, Nov 5, 2021 at 5:40 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Azlan, 

  

  

Kindly assist on the towing fee of $150 payment status. 
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: TeamAuto Pro [mailto:teamautoffice@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 5 November 2021 5:30 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FW: Own Damage Claim Settlement - SKH 4618U (AIG Policy# 1700076562-03 / DOA: 24-03-2021 

  

Dear Veron, 

  

FYI, we received $9350.43 dated 03-11-2021 for the subject invoice. However, we are still pending $150 for 
Tow Fee incurred as reflected on our Debit Note. 

  

Kindly assist to check on $150 payment status. 

  

Thank you. 
 

  

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not 

prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 
injuries.* 

  

**Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro Pte Ltd is GST registered w.e.f. 13th January 
2021.  



3

--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

Cheers, 

Adel 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6258 1955 

Fax: 6258 1956 

  

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

  

  

  


