Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 4:11 PM

To: TeamAutoPro North; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Parthiban, Theerthan; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts

Subject: AIGENCRYPT RE: Re: FW: Aigencrypt OD claim SKH4618U / 9780225002SG -

Request for police report, undertaking & interview form

Dear Peach,

Received with thanks. Excess has been updated to $600.

Thanks and regards,

Syaza Irdina Azlan

AIG

Express Claims Adjuster Il, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
SG Claims Operations | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Tel:8001206556 | Ext:1012205

Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 2:59 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Parthiban, Theerthan
<Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts <NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: FW: Aigencrypt OD claim SKH4618U / 9780225002SG - Request for police report,
undertaking & interview form

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Veron
Attached as per requested.

Do let us know if you still need any further information
Thank you!

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Note: Dear all, please note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST from 13th January 2021.

Cheers,
Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd



Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956
Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Mon, Mar 29, 2021 at 9:23 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Peach,

Kindly assist as per AIG request.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 9:19 AM

To: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts
<NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>

Subject: RE: Aigencrypt OD claim SKH4618U / 9780225002SG - Request for police report, undertaking & interview
form

Dear Azlan,

Thank you for your email.



Dear Veron,

CS/AIG21003946/Bvf3

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 9:16 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts
<NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>

Subject: Aigencrypt OD claim SKH4618U / 9780225002SG - Request for police report, undertaking & interview form

Dear Denise,

Kindly assist to provide us with insured’s police report as the accident involved government property together with
undertaking letter and interview form from insured.

Thank you.

Thanks and regards,

Syaza Irdina Azlan



AlIG
Express Claims Adjuster I, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
SG Claims Operations | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Tel:8001206556 | Ext:1012205

Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



