Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 April 2021 11:43 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SMD7587C - Finalising

From: Wei Shong <wei.shong@timotor.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 April 2021 11:42:21 AM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMD7587C - Finalising

Dear Taufikh,

Confirmed

Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Lic

TANLM

Lam Wei Shong O. +65 6858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim I
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 28, 2021 11:38 AM

To: 'Wei Shong' <wei.shong@tIimotor.com.sg>

Cc: 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)' <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SMD7587C - Finalising

Hi William,
COR I/s $3800, 5 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Wei Shong [mailto:wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sq]
Sent: Wednesday, 21 April 2021 10:05 AM
To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'




Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'
Subject: FW: SMD7587C - Finalising

Dear Taufikh,

Please finalise with us as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Lic

La_n! Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +65 68580877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@timotor.com.sg http://www.tlmotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim |
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: Wei Shong [mailto:wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, April 1, 2021 6:13 PM

To: 'taufikh@lkkauto.com' <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg' <sharon.ten@tlmotor.com.sg>
Subject: SMD7587C - Finalising

Dear Taufikh,
Enclosed the revised estimate for your finalising.

Lump sum repair $3,800.00 and 5 days repair.

Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Lim Motor Pte Lic

La_m_ Wei Shong O. +656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
William F. +65 68580877 Singapore 539365
wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim I
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-v
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.
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