Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 May 2021 8:03 AM

To: Joel Goh (joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg)

Cc: SUR; LEE KATIE; LeeGek@smrt.com.sg; CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: FW: LOD Re: Accident on 24/3/2021 involving SHB 5500K & SLK 100U (EQ's
insured) Our Ref: TAX/03/21/2076/Ig

Attachments: 03 21 2076.pdf

Dear Joel,

Attach TP LOD for your necessary action, ref no DM21H0O00514-JG.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 May 2021 6:30 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: LOD Re: Accident on 24/3/2021 involving SHB 5500K & SLK 100U (EQ's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/03/21/2076/Ig

Hi
Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/FM(Mil)&SS/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 May, 2021 2:39 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 24/3/2021 involving SHB 5500K & SLK 100U (EQ's insured) Our Ref: TAX/03/21/2076/Ig

Dear All,



We quantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of Repair $850.13
Loss of Rental $164.25 2.25 daysx $73.00 )
Loss of Income $135.00 2.25 day x $60.00 )
LTA Search Fee $7.00
Total $1,156.38

We enclose the following documents:

1) Repairinvoice

2) Proof of ren
3) GlA report

4) Accident vehicle laid-up report

5) LTA search

6) Hirer’s letter of authorisation

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6556 3548)

Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte L1d

tal rate

@smnr
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