Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 20 April 2021 1:59 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: 'Zhe Wei Kek'; 'Wai Yin Ng'

Subject: RE: AAD2103-108 FINALISE--SHD636A

Dear Shiau Chan

Amount confirm: $9,750.00 (before GST)
Thank you.

Best Regards

Amanda
Claims Department

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, April 20, 2021 10:20 AM

To: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Zhe Wei Kek' <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>; 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Subject: RE: AAD2103-108 FINALISE--SHD636A

Dear Amanda,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Based on our surveyor’s marking estimate, the calculation of repair cost will be at Lump Sum $9,750.00 before GST
and 8 repair days.

Kindly check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 April 2021 2:24 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong
(LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Zhe Wei Kek' <zhewei.kek@transcab.com.sg>; 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: AAD2103-108 FINALISE--SHD636A

Dear Sir/ Officer-in charge
Kindly please refer to the above subject matter.

We would like to finalise with you for this case.



Enclosed is the marked estimate and here’s the working for your perusal.

Kindly please check to confirm the amounts and revert to our e-mail within 3 working days, (16/04/2021).

Thank you.



AAD2103-103
SHD636A-EQ- 19.03.21

PARTS

) 2,844.66
b 2,844.66
$ 169.90
$ 450.60
b 758.10
g 364.70
$ 229.20
$ 100.50
b 155.80
g 116.10
$ 1,933.20
$ 401.40
g 1,184.99

$ 1155381
10% $ 1,155.38
$ 10,398.43

S/NETT

60.00
60.00
15.00
40.00
30.00

R R A A A Al

$ 205.00

LABOUR

50.00
120.00
120.00
100.00
1,200.00
120.00
1,100.00

20.00

B R R A R A -]

$ 2,830.00



Best Regards

Amanda
Claims Department



