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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 January 2022 3:58 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJC 1819 P - GIA & EST

Dear All, 
 

Please advise LOD to be sent to? 
 

Warmest Regards, 
Elin Cai 

 

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd 

130 Bedok Reservoir Road  
#08-1339 Singapore 470130 

9450 7920 

zoomautowerks@gmail.com 

 

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July 

2018 - 

 

 

On Wed, Jan 12, 2022 at 3:53 PM Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear All, 
 
Confirm with thanks. 

 
Warmest Regards, 

Elin Cai 

 

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd 

130 Bedok Reservoir Road  

#08-1339 Singapore 470130 

9450 7920 

zoomautowerks@gmail.com 

 

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July 
2018 - 

 

 

On Tue, Jan 4, 2022 at 11:49 AM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Elin, 

  

“Without Prejudice” 
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We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $4250 with 6 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

  

From: Zoom Autowerks [mailto:zoomautowerks@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 11 May 2021 10:14 PM 

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com 
Subject: Re: SJC 1819 P - GIA & EST 

  

Dear Taufik, 

  

Kindly assist to finalise with us.  

  

Warmest Regards, 

Elin Cai 

  

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd 

130 Bedok Reservoir Road  

#08-1339 Singapore 470130 

9450 7920 

zoomautowerks@gmail.com 

  

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July 
2018 - 
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On Sun, Apr 18, 2021 at 10:44 PM Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Taufik, 

  

Kindly refer to attached. 

  

Warmest Regards, 

Elin Cai 

  

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd 

130 Bedok Reservoir Road  

#08-1339 Singapore 470130 

9450 7920 

zoomautowerks@gmail.com 

  

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July 

2018 - 


