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Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH 1577L(AIG) AND SLZ 6505S AT/ALONG 231A PASIR
RIS DRIVE 4 MULTI-STOREY CARPARK ON 23/03/2021 (Pics Part 2)

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Wed 4/8/2021 4:16 PM
To:  Margrib Sha <margribsha@gmail.com>

Dear Mr Margrib Sha, 
 
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that we do not have a good defense towards third party
claim against your policy. As there is no video footage to show exactly how the accident happened, we are
only able to review the case based on both parties reports as well as the damage photographs. Based on both
parties report,  we can agree on the followings: - 

1. Your vehicle was coming out from parking lot. 
2. Third party was on main driveway. 

As for damages to both vehicles, if based on your statement, damage to third party vehicle should have been
more on frontal portion instead of focus on left front corner. Therefore, it is hard for us to defense the case.
Under Motor Accident Guide, any vehicle when moving out of parking lot should give way to vehicles
approaching along the driveway. Generally, third party on the driveway has the right of way but should keep a
lookout for vehicles moving out of parking lots, however that only contribute to 10%-20% of the liability
(under the Motor Accident Guideline). Whereas the bulk liability falls onto the party who was moving out of a
parking lot. 


In view of the above, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best
to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. Please be assured that we will do our due
diligence to mitigate the cost. 


Thank you. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Margrib Sha <margribsha@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 5:39 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH 1577L(AIG) AND SLZ 6505S AT/ALONG 231A PASIR RIS DRIVE 4 MULTI-
STOREY CARPARK ON 23/03/2021 (Pics Part 2)
 
Here are the remaining photos. 

On Thu, 22 Apr 2021, 16:42 Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto), <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

22 April 2021
 
Mr MARGRIB SHA BIN ABDUL WAHAB                                             [By Email Only]
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Dear Sir/Madam,
 
You Ref: SLH1577L
Our Ref: CC4/AIG21003894/Apa3
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH 1577L(AIG) AND SLZ 6505S AT/ALONG 231A PASIR RIS DRIVE 4 MULTI-STOREY
CARPARK ON 23/03/2021
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy.
 
We have received a claim from SLZ 6505S against your insurance policy.
 
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your
insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.
 
As per our tele-conversation earlier, kindly assist to send us all the accident scene photos for our further
action.
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter.
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-
Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and
your NCD will be protected.
 
Please call us if you have further queries.
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> LEO KHING POK. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(200926) TOYOTA PREVIA 2.4 8-SEATER (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Clm
Created

Reg No: SLZ6505S. Acct Date: 2021/03/23. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
(SG). TP Insurer: NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Ishare Auto Pte. Ltd. (HQ)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/04/06 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Exp
ress)

[I] Merimen
Administrator

8
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Label
Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

9
25 Mar
2021
17:38

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> ADRIAN LING [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
20 Jun
2021
23:43

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

11
20 Jun
2021
23:43

Clm Dtl
Modified Insured ID: -> -. Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

12
20 Jun
2021
23:43

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2010/10/07.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

13
20 Jun
2021
23:43

Clm
Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

14
11 Aug
2021
09:28

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:3616.45:Liability: 100%(B24)
*Quantum: (a)COR: $3,100.00 + (b)LOR(3days x $160.00): $48
0.00 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $36.45 = Total: $3,616.45
*4 recommendation repair days
*For your app
roval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

15
11 Aug
2021
16:11

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/04/06. Mandate Remarks: mandate approved. subject to documetns i
n order. LOR @ $120/day. settle at best.

[I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

16
11 Aug
2021
16:11

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:3496.45:mandate approved. subject to documetns in order. LOR @ $120/day. settle at best. [I] Goh,
Jeremy-CX

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
[22/04/2021 16:13] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Spoken to OI, Mr Margrib Sha. Confirm accident. He disagreed that he is 100% at fault. According to him, he saw TP stopped and prepared to
reverse park in the parking lot on his right(few lots away),he came out from his lot while third party suddenly moved forward as resulted the
accident. OI said that after the accident, TP driver told him that he moved fwd as there is a pillar block his way on reversing. Advised OI that it
is hard to defense if no video footage. OI understand that not possible to reject. But he think that it is not fair to him if he is 100% at fault. He
only agreed 50/50. He also said that he had submitted all his scene photos to AIG for review. OI hope AIG can fight at least 50/50. Not 100%
against him. Informed him that we will try our best and update if there is any issue.
[22/04/2021 16:13] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
TP no video.



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2680763 26 Mar 2021
11:30:47

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SLZ6505S SLH1577L 11.00

2702786 20 Jun 2021
23:43:04

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SLZ6505S SLH1577L 11.00
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