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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 31 May 2021 12:07 PM
To: Lim Ai Lee
Subject: RE: Your ref: GH-1118-M      Our ref: GBD-5979-Z // LKK Ref: 

CC4/III21003884/R1pa3
Attachments: DV_GBD5979Z.pdf

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Thank you for acceptance. 
  
Please duly sign the DV enclosed return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our necessary action: - 
 

 Original Repair Tax Invoice bill to India International Insurance Pte Ltd. 
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Lim Ai Lee <AiLee.Lim@ethozgroup.com>  
Sent: Friday, 28 May 2021 5:22 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your ref: GH-1118-M Our ref: GBD-5979-Z // LKK Ref: CC4/III21003884/R1pa3 
 
Dear Sir,  
 
We refer to your email below.  
 
We agreed your settlement at $1,400.00 all in.  
 
Kindly provide Discharge Voucher.  
 
Thank you.  
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Warmest Regards, 
Lim Ai Lee  
Claim Settlement 
 

 
ETHOZ GROUP LTD 
22 Tampines Street 92 Singapore 528876 
DID: 6654 7920 
FAX: 6654 7540 
Website: www.ethozgroup.com  
 

            
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Friday, May 28, 2021 5:05 PM 
To: Lim Ai Lee <AiLee.Lim@ethozgroup.com> 
Subject: Re: Your ref: GH-1118-M Our ref: GBD-5979-Z // LKK Ref: CC4/III21003884/R1pa3 
 

[EXTERNAL EMAIL] This email originated from a non-ETHOZ GROUP address. Please exercise caution when clicking links or 
opening attachments from external sources. 

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement at $1,400.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.  

  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Friday, 7 May 2021 5:36 PM 
To: Lim Ai Lee <AiLee.Lim@ethozgroup.com> 
Subject: RE: Your ref: GH-1118-M Our ref: GBD-5979-Z // LKK Ref: CC4/III21003884/R1pa3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 07/05/2021. 
  
We will look into the matter and get back to you. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Lim Ai Lee <AiLee.Lim@ethozgroup.com>  
Sent: Friday, 7 May 2021 2:37 PM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your ref: GH-1118-M Our ref: GBD-5979-Z 
  
Dear Sir/ Madam,  
  
We refer to the above matter.  
  
We attached Letter of Demand for your necessary action.  
  
Kindly let us hear from you as soon.  
  
Thank you. 
  
Warmest Regards, 
Lim Ai Lee  
Claim Settlement 
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ETHOZ GROUP LTD 
22 Tampines Street 92 Singapore 528876 
DID: 6654 7920 
FAX: 6654 7540 
Website: www.ethozgroup.com  
  

            
  

From: Lim Ai Lee  
Sent: Wednesday, April 7, 2021 3:05 PM 
To: 'chewht@lkkauto.com' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your ref: GH-1118-M Our ref: GBD-5979-Z 
  
Dear Sir/ Madam,  
  
We refer to the above matter.  
  
We attached Letter of Demand for your necessary action.  
  
Kindly let us hear from you as soon.  
  
Thank you.  
  
  
Warmest Regards, 
Lim Ai Lee  
Claim Settlement 
  

 
ETHOZ GROUP LTD 
22 Tampines Street 92 Singapore 528876 
DID: 6654 7920 
Website: www.ethozgroup.com  

            
  
Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee named 
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, 
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the 
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ 
Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication 
is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual 
sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable 
for the improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay 
in its receipt or damage to your system.  
Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee named 
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, 
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the 
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ 
Group does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication 
is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual 
sender and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ Group. ETHOZ Group shall not be responsible nor liable 
for the improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay 
in its receipt or damage to your system.  


