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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 April 2021 9:32 AM

To: Xinya Auto Services

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLV 6756E DOA : 24/03/21

Hi May, 

 

Finalised amount of $ 4,700 / 6 days of lump sum repair is confirmed 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 26 April, 2021 3:40 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: SLV 6756E DOA : 24/03/21 

 

Hi, Rasul 

 

Boss say $4700 6days 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, April 26, 2021 9:23 AM 

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SLV 6756E DOA : 24/03/21 

 

7 days 

 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 26 April, 2021 9:23 AM 
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To: 'Xinya Auto Services' 
Subject: RE: SLV 6756E DOA : 24/03/21 

 

Hi May, 

 

Close at 4,600 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Xinya Auto Services [mailto:xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg]  
Sent: Saturday, 24 April, 2021 12:50 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: SLV 6756E DOA : 24/03/21 

 

HI, Rasul 

 

Can we close at $4700 7days 

 

Thank you 

Regards 

may 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) [mailto:Rasul@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, April 22, 2021 3:59 PM 

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg> 

Subject: SLV 6756E DOA : 24/03/21 

 

Hi Kevin, 

 

Refer to attachment 

Finalised amount is $ 4,500 / 6 days of lump sum repair 

Kindly confim 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necSave the Earth. Print only when necSave the Earth. Print only when necSave the Earth. Print only when necessary.essary.essary.essary. 
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