Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 March 2022 2:00 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: GBJ 4508A - Finalize

Attachments: GBJ 4508 main estimate.pdf

Hi Veron,

Workshop agreed finalize.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 March 2022 12:18 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'jessie.ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg
<ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; 'andrew.goh' <andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>
Subject: RE: GBJ 4508A - Finalize

Hi Steve,
We confirm and accept COR L/S $3,700.00 in 4 repair days.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
37 Loyang Way, Singapore 508734

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims @ gmail.com




From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 March 2022 1:59 pm

To: 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@ panpacificleasing.com.sg>; andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg
Cc: Efficient Motor <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Subject: GBJ 4508 - Finalize

Hi Jessy/Andrew

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $3700 (L/S before GST) - with 4 days of repair, subject
to their approval.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




