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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 11:13 AM
To: 'David Ang'
Cc: Admin A; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/AIG21003860/Upa3
Attachments: DV_SFJ 4005L.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 10:47 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/AIG21003860/Upa3 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We agree & accept your global sum offer of $ 7,900.00 for client's third party claims settlement, 
Please let us have your settlement soonest, as we need to update client's assigned solicitors. 
 

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 
On Mon, 10 May 2021 at 08:47, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Mr David, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement at a global sum of $7,900.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 May 2021 4:37 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/AIG21003860/Upa3 
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Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

Thanks for your reply, any way i had forward your email reply to the client's lawyer office, PLease let 
us have your settlement by (7) days, as client's solicitors instruction, Beyond our control. 

  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Tue, 4 May 2021 at 16:26, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Mr David, 

  

We refer your below email. 

  

We are seeking further mandate from our principal on this matter. 

  

We will expedite the matter and get back to you. 

  

Kindly hold hands for time being. Thanks. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 May 2021 4:25 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/AIG21003860/Upa3 

  

Dear  Hsiao Tong, 

  

When can we have the full settlement ? Failing, client's solicitors will issue LOD direct to your insurer 
& insured, as we have not received your reply, due on : 26/04/21. 

  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Thu, 22 Apr 2021 at 13:25, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

We refer to the above reference, Kindly update us the discharge voucher for full settlements, as 
client's would like to have the reply by this weekend (26/04/21) Please let us hear from you soon. 

  

On Thu, 15 Apr 2021 at 12:12, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Noted with thanks.  
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On Thu, 15 Apr 2021 at 12:11, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Mr David, 

  

Noted. We will expedite the matter. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 15 April 2021 12:07 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/AIG21003860/Upa3 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

Noted, but don't take too long, as client's solicitors are keep chasing me & asking for the case, 
due to the third party drivers refusing to private settle after the accident & inform client's to do 
insurance reports & claims. 

  

On Thu, 15 Apr 2021 at 12:01, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 
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Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We are seeking mandate for this matter. 

  

We will expedite the matter and get back to you. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 15 April 2021 11:56 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: RE : YOUR REF : CC6/AIG21003860/Upa3 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

When can we have the discharge voucher for the direct settlements in full ? As lenient's solicitors 
are chasing me for the settlements, Failing, we will taking over the case, PLease revert,  
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On Mon, 5 Apr 2021 at 12:14, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sirs, 

  

PLease revert & confirm client's third party claims liability for direct settlement, as we need to 
update client's & his assign solicitors, 

  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Wed, 31 Mar 2021 at 13:30, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

Attach our letter of demand, final bill, GIA third party insurer search fee & owner authorisation 
letter for your reference & attention, 

  

Kindly revert & confirm for direct settlement, as we need to update client's & his solicitors for 
further action, 

  

We will forward the original documents to you by mail. 

  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  
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--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 

  

--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 

  

--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 

  

--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  
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--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 

  

--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 

  

--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 
 
--  
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  


