Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 31 May 2021 9:34 PM

To: Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif

Cc: Toh Jing Xuan; Bernard Wan Chong Huat; Cresendo Llurca Lagman; Keith Leo Chi Yung;
Teng Wai Khan; Han Kwan Yong; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT-SLZ3508D

Attachments: SLZ 3508 main estimate (1).pdf; SLZ 3508 supp.pdf

Hi Mohamad,

We confirm the finalize $18,684.50 (P/P, before GST). 13 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif <mohd.sanif@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 31 May 2021 10:30 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing.xuan@simedarby.com.sg>; Bernard Wan Chong Huat <bernard.wan@simedarby.com.sg>;
Cresendo Llurca Lagman <cresendo.lagman@simedarby.com.sg>; Keith Leo Chi Yung
<keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg>; Teng Wai Khan <teng.wai.khan@simedarby.com.sg>; Han Kwan Yong
<han.kwan.yong@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT FINAL REPORT-SLZ3508D

Hi STEVE,

For Your Perusal:

Labour $10,701.00
Parts $7,983.50
Total $18,684.50

Note: No of working days: 11 working days.



LOSS OF USE=$120 X 13 DAYS
GIA SEARCH FEE=$2.00

Thank you.

Best regard,

Mohd.Sanif
Bodyshop

BMW

Performance Motors

DDI: +65 6319 0148

FAX: +65 6474 3229

Address : 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941
Email: mohd.sanif @simedarby.com.sg

www.bmw.com.sg

Sime Darby Motors
A member of the Sime Darby Group

CHOOSE YOUR JOY.

Visit BMW

Find out mora




