Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 10:14 AM

To: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; SUR

Subject: RE: AIGENCRYPT OD SMJ8928P DOA 20/03/2021

Dear Mariesa,

Thank you for the email.

We will submit our report and invoice using “disable” button, once done will informed you.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>
Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 10:09 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: AIGENCRYPT OD SMJ8928P DOA 20/03/2021

Dear all,

Received addendum insured is converting to third party claim. Kindly advise if adjuster invoice has been submitted
before we close the claim. Thank you.

accident Private use

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy for repair to

your vehicle? Mo - Claiming third party
Vehicle Category Private car

Tranemiceinm Ada

Insurance Company: __ T]1E]

(B) ADDITIONALINFORMATION / AMENDMENTS:

I have made a report on the above mentioned accident and would like to include additional inf

armationor
make the following amendments:

Aweod fo THRD PARTY CLAIM

Best regards,

Mariesa Abu Kassim (Mariesa)
AlIG
Claims Adjuster Il
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