Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 March 2021 2:44 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto); SUR; ‘assignments'

Cc: Stanley Lai; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10009538/ST || OI-SLX9952A (White) TP-SDQ1865C || Est:
$ || Zoom Autowerks

Attachments: SKOK21300002_24-03-2021_130827.pdf

Hi Team,

We would like to arrange TP survey for SDQ1865C. TP chose Mr. Marcus Chua to survey the vehicle. Our PH has not
reported yet.

Workshop information:

Zom Autowerks

Please contact : 9450 7920

Blk 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4, Bartley Biz Centre, #01-53, Singapore 417808

Please confirm. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)

1



reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is
for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may
be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use,
interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 March 2021 2:27 PM

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Pre-Repair Inspection for SDQ 1865 C // Accident on 24/03/2021 @ 09:01HR at along Bishan Flyover
towards Lornie Road involving Vehicle Number SDQ 1865 C & SLX 9952 A | |

Dear All,

Kindly arrange Marcus Chua LKK.

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 March 2021 2:17 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Pre-Repair Inspection for SDQ 1865 C // Accident on 24/03/2021 @ 09:01HR at along Bishan Flyover
towards Lornie Road involving Vehicle Number SDQ 1865 C & SLX 9952 A

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are instructed by Ng Cheng Chow, Collin to notify you of a road traffic accident on 24/03
/2021

at about 09:01R along Bishan Flyover towards Lornie Road involving our client's vehicle registration
number SDQ 1865 C and vehicle registration number SLX 9952 A driven by your insured at the material
time.

A copy of the Singapore Accident Statement/Traffic Police Report filed is enclosed. As a result of the
accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceeds to repair the damaged vehicle,
please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you would like to conduct
a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated time, our
client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please contact me @ 9450 7920, should you require more information.

Kindly arrange survey at Blk 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4, Bartley Biz Centre, #01-53, Singapore 4178
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Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130

9450 7920

“Bzoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July
2018 -
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