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Re: Fw: SBR332Z, Volvo V90, After painting, Photo 1 of 3. (FINALISE)

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Mon 26/7/2021 8:40 AM
To:  William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>; admin <Admin@lbs-auto.com>

Hi William,

Please sent your documents to MSIG Insurance directly

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 July 2021, 08:22

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); Veron Chen (LKKAuto); William Tan; admin

Subject: Re: Fw: SBR332Z, Volvo V90, After painting, Photo 1 of 3. (FINALISE)


Dear Sir / Madam,

SBR332Z, Accident dated 14 March 2021,

I accept part by part cost of repair amount at $4,196.50 and 3 working days for the repair
work

By the way, all documents send to LKK or directly to MSIG Insurance ?

On Sun, 25 Jul 2021 at 4:36 PM, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi William,


Can confirm?


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 July 2021 9:20 PM

To: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SBR332Z, Volvo V90, After painting, Photo 1 of 3.
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Dear William,


Part by part $4,196.50, 3days


Please check and confirm


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 16 July 2021 7:41 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
<KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>

Subject: Fwd: SBR332Z, Volvo V90, After painting, Photo 1 of 3.
 
Dear Sir,



Please refer to attach documents.



SBR332Z, Volvo  V90, After painting, Photo 1 of 3.



Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link

attachments:
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Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent

sending or receiving certain types of file attachments.  Check your e-mail

security settings to determine how attachments are handled.
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