Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 March 2021 10:49 AM

To: Chew, Elizabeth

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GAIC REF: CLMOMVC000003972 XE3896B CHECK MARKET VALUE

Dear Elizabeth,

The MV of XE 3896B is $160K-$170K(est) as at March 2021.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Chew@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 8:31 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GAIC REF: CLMOMVC000003972 XE3896B CHECK MARKET VALUE

Dear Shiau Chan,
We attached insured’s GIA report for your perusal, thank you.

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to
GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com

For work injury compensation act (WICA) claims, please email to wicaclaims@sg.gaig.com

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com

Regards
Elizabeth Chew, Assistant Manager, Claims | P. +65 68047845 | F. +65 62353354 | elizabeth.chew@sg.gaig.com
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Thank you for your trust in us. We're proud to continue to serve you during this unprecedented
time. As COVID-19 continues to affect us all, we assure you that we remain committed to providing
the high level of service you deserve. Read more.

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: 12 March 2021 3:19 PM

To: Chew, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Chew@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: GAIC REF: CLMOMYVYC000003972 XE3896B CHECK MARKET VALUE

Dear Elizabeth,

Kindly provide us some general photos of above vehicle.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew, Elizabeth <Elizabeth.Chew@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 4:55 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: GAIC REF: CLMOMVC000003972 XE3896B CHECK MARKET VALUE

Dear Denise,
Please let us have the market value for vehicle XE3896B as at date of loss 01/03/2021.
Attached is the vehicle log card for your perusal.

Thank you.

For all first claim notifications on Property & Casualty Claims (excluding Motor claims), please email to
GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com

For work injury compensation act (WICA) claims, please email to wicaclaims@sg.gaig.com

For motor claims enquiries, please email to motorclaims@sg.gaig.com

For all first claim notifications on Marine Claims, please email to marineclaims@sg.gaig.com

Regards
Elizabeth Chew, Assistant Manager, Claims | P. +65 68047845 | F. +65 62353354 | elizabeth.chew@sg.gaig.com
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