Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 2:43 PM

To: Tok Wei Jie

Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg; Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: Estimate for XD6344M

Attachments: XE6344M BREAK DOWN EST.pdf

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle XD 6344M (Excess $2000/-). Not exceeding at
$30,000/-(lump sum).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to
arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tok Wei Jie <tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 27 March 2021 10:08:52 AM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg <wskoh@vfixauto.com.sg>

Subject: Estimate for XD6344M

Hi Rasul,
Please find attached estimate breakdown.
Remark: W.e.f 29™ MARCH 2021, our office has been relocated to 7 Penjuru Close Level 1, Singapore

608779. Please update your record with the following: Company contact number - 6455 2957 ; Company
general email - contact@vfixauto.com.sg

Thank you.



Best regards,

=
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Ly

Tok Wei Jie

Claim Administrator Cum Purchaser

Vfix Auto Pte Ltd | Vfix Rental Pte Ltd

26 Chia Ping Road Singapore 619977

Contact: 6455 2957 | E: tokwj@vfixauto.com.sg




